
                      I Will Establish You 
 
                                Isaiah 14:1-2 
 
   Babylon was the pride and joy of the Chaldeans, a ruthless and 
cruel people, and God executed judgement on them. They ruled 
over the Israelites, but God turned the tables on them. God said 
he would destroy Babylon, but he would not do that with Jacob. 
He would have compassion on Jacob and choose Israel. 
   The Babylonians would become slaves to Israel and serve 
them. They ruled over them in Babylon, but now they would be 
the ones who would bless Israel.  
   We must be careful how we treat one another. God chooses 
whoever he wishes to rule. One day it may be you, and the next 
day it may be the person you are opposed to. Jesus said the ‘son 
of man’ did not come to be served, but to serve and give his life 
as a ransom for many. 
   Although the prodigal son wasted his resources, his father 
welcomed him back with open arms and reestablished him as his 
son. On the way to Calvary’s cross, Jesus was beaten, but the 
Roman soldiers did not realize that they were escorting him back 
to glory. 
   God will send you an escort. He will bless you, your home, your 
land, and prepare it before you get there. He will make you a royal 
priesthood. God will fight for your future, children, and home. 
   In Isaiah 66:2 God says, “I will bring you back to my temple as a 
grain offering.” God redeems his people and blesses them. When 
the Israelites left Egypt, they left with the wealth of the land. 



Nations will bless you that are not righteous, holy and do not have 
faith in Jesus Christ.  
   God will make you the master. He will send you help from the 
sanctuary and support from Zion. 


