
 

 

Faith Formation 

At-Home Family Faith Formation Tip - Rain For Roots is a collective 
of songwriters that includes Sandra McCracken, Katy Bowser, Ellie 
Holcomb, and Flo Paris. They came together around a single vision: to 
make new Scripture songs for children, centered around the poetry of 
Sally Lloyd-Jones (author of The Jesus Storybook Bible). Inspired by 
traditional folk melodies, Rain for Roots makes new, timeless songs 
about the old gospel Story. Check them out at RainforRoots.com. (Tip 
from Faith Formation; bit.ly/CRCFaithFormation) 

ReFrame Ministries 

Family Fire - is an online community exploring Spirit-led family, 
marriage, parenting, in-laws, blended families, and intimacy. Find 
encouraging articles and devotions at familyfire.com. Subscribe for 
regular email updates and connect with our Family Fire community on 
Facebook. 

God's Idea of Justice - Check out this week’s kids’ devotion at 
www.kidscorner.net. Imagine that you see someone being bullied. Do 
you just watch, or turn away, or do you try to help the person being 
bullied? How does God want you to respond? What is God’s idea of 
justice? Check out all the great content at kidscorner.net like the Kids 
Corner Valentine Cards. 

Groundwork: Seeing Jesus Christ in Heaven - The Bible’s final book 
of Revelation has long been a source of mystery to Christians across 
the ages. Join our Groundwork conversation as we study Revelation 1 
to examine the opening images of John’s heavenly vision and discuss 
the comfort it offers believers still today. Listen now at 
Groundworkonline.com and subscribe to Groundwork's weekly emails 
for future episodes. 

CRC Communications 

Position Opening: Director of Advancement (Canada) - Join the 
CRCNA staff team to provide leadership in strategic planning for the 
ministry share program, church and donor engagement, grants and 
planned giving, and other means of supporting the dynamic ministries 
of the Christian Reformed Church. This full-time position can be remote 
within Canada. For details and to apply, go to 
https://crcna.pinpointhq.com/en/jobs/81800 



Safe Church 

Annual Inter-Classis Safe Church Conference - Classis Huron’s 
annual inter-classis safe church event is happening in person again this 
year! Join us on Saturday, March 4, 2023, 9:00 am - 3:30 pm at 
Waterloo CRC, Waterloo, Ontario. Dr. Amanda Benckhuysen, Ministry 
Team Leader for Safe Church, will speak on “The Use and Misuse of 
Power in the Church.“ Christian Horizons Education Director Steve 
Snider ‘s presentation will focus on supporting a person living with a 
disability. Carol Penner will present on “Repentance and Accountability: 
Forgiveness is Not the First Step.” For more information and registration 
go to https://www.wmott.ca/scc 

Pastor Church Resources 

Offering for Pastor Church Resources - On Sunday, February 19, 
we’ll be taking a collection for Pastor Church Resources (PCR). This 
ministry focuses on the health and wellbeing of pastors, ministry 
leaders, congregations, and classes. Your gift enables PCR to 
resource, encourage, and support CRC churches and leaders in 
significant ways. 

World Renew 

Share Christ’s Hope with Syria/Türkiye Earthquake Survivors - On 
Monday, February 6, 2023, two major earthquakes rocked Syria and 
Türkiye (Turkey) killing at least 11,000 people and leaving thousands 
more injured. And as rescue workers search for survivors in the rubble 
of collapsed buildings, the death toll is expected to rise. In hard-hit 
northern Syria, a region heavily populated by refugee families who had 
already been struggling with food insecurity, an ongoing cholera 
outbreak, and the challenges of sub-zero winter weather, there is an 
urgent need for humanitarian aid. Through your gifts to World Renew, 
you can help provide emergency food and essentials and share Christ’s 
hope with the most vulnerable people impacted by this disaster. Please 
give generously today at worldrenew.ca/syria-earthquake or call 888-
975-3769. 

 


